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Queensland abolished public examinations over 30 years ago and replaced them 
with a system of moderated school-based assessment. The system has flourished 
and has long since ceased to be contentious. It is now accepted as ‘normal 
business’. This paper is about some of the characteristics of school-based 
assessment as practiced in Queensland for certification at the end of secondary 
education (the Senior Certificate), some of the principles that lie behind it and some 
of the lessons and caveats. 
 
One of the original aims of the change to school-based assessment was to broaden 
the curriculum, both through what is assessed (extending beyond paper-and-pencil 
examinations) and what courses are offered (extending beyond academic subjects 
and pre-university studies). This broadening has occurred and is continuing. Over the 
past 30 years, the range of available academic subjects has increased substantially, 
a range of subjects of a more general nature has been developed, and vocational 
education and training options have been introduced. Further broadening of the 
available ‘learning packages’ has been announced in the Queensland Government’s 
White Paper, Education and Training Reforms for the Future (ETRF). Some aspects 
of these reforms are still being discussed, some are being developed and some are 
being trialled. The aim is to cater to the learning needs of all students, require all 
students to be ‘learning or earning’ until they are 17 years of age, and to provide 
young people with appropriate foundation for further learning and work. It is 
premature to focus on these reforms at this stage. 
 
School-based assessment for the Senior Certificate assumes the following 
characteristics: 

• Assessment involves teacher judgments of the quality of student learning 
• Student learning is demonstrated through performance (evidence of learning) 
• Evidence of learning is collected over time and collated in a student portfolio 
• Quality of student learning is judged against specified performance standards 
• Performance standards are expressed as a rubric or ‘criteria and standards 

matrix’ 
• Criteria are the qualities or dimensions on which performance is to be judged 
• Standards are graded categories indicating different levels of performance 
• Standards are represented by descriptive statements and illustrative 

exemplars 
• Five graded categories (levels of achievement) are used for formal reporting. 

 
The integrity of the Senior Certificate is protected by a moderation system directed at 
quality assurance of the reported levels of achievement. An important tenet of the 
moderation system is that assessments do not have to be identical to be comparable. 
The contents of student portfolios can differ substantially but can be judged 
appropriately against common standards. The comparability question is not whether 
two portfolios are identical but whether they are equivalent in terms of the specified 
standards. This involves judgment—an interpretation of the quality of student 
performance, synthesised across all the components of the portfolio. 
 
To understand Queensland’s approach to moderation, it is first necessary to 
understand that courses are based on subject syllabuses. These syllabuses are 
broad frameworks that allow flexibility of local implementation. Thus each subject that 
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a school intends to teach needs to be turned into a teaching and assessment plan 
(‘work plan’) by the school. The criteria and standards matrix for final (‘exit’ or ‘end of 
course’) levels of achievement (for recording on the Senior Certificate) is restated in 
terms of the specifics of the school’s work plan.  
 
Appropriate coverage of all the intended learning outcomes of the syllabus requires 
the use of a variety of assessment activities. It would, for example, be inappropriate 
for assessment to involve only written examinations. All subjects involve other forms 
of learning than those assessable through written examinations. This expansion of 
the forms of learning was one of the original intentions of the move to school-based 
assessment. It allows for more authentic assessment to occur, connecting with 
student interests and making learning and assessment more meaningful and 
applicable for students (Cumming and Maxwell, 1999; Darling-Hammond, Ancess 
and Falk, 1995).  
 
An important principle, therefore, is that the forms of assessment allow for all the 
intended learning outcomes to be appropriately assessed. A corollary is that any 
judgment of student learning should be appropriate and justifiable (valid) in terms of 
the evidence on which it is based. That is, unwarranted conclusions should not be 
drawn about the student’s learning—as, for example, would be the case if inferences 
were drawn about a student’s capacity to deliver a speech based on a written 
examination. Further, the total context in which the student’s performance occurs is 
important for interpreting the evidence—for example, whether assistance has been 
provided for completing an activity when the intention is to assess the extent of the 
student’s unassisted capability. This is not to say that assistance is inappropriate but 
that the extent to which assistance has been provided changes the nature of the 
inference concerning what the student actually knows and can do. Scaffolding 
student learning in this way is best provided at the limits of the student’s knowledge 
and capability so that the student is not prevented from demonstrating the actual 
extent of their knowledge and capability. Assessment should allow the student to 
stretch themselves to the limits of their knowledge and capability before any 
assistance is provided to assist them to go further. 
 
 
Progressive or continuous assessment 
 
An important principle of school-based assessment is that the assessment is 
progressive or continuous. One of the aims of school-based assessment is to 
alleviate the peak pressure of a single final examination—the one-shot test on which 
everything depends. This requires not only that assessment is tailored to the way in 
which each subject syllabus is implemented by the school but also that assessment 
occurs progressively over the whole course of study. In other words, the validity of 
the assessment is improved by assembling the portfolio from a variety of assessment 
types and contexts. So too is the reliability improved by having many opportunities for 
the student to demonstrate their knowledge and capability and by collecting the 
information on many different occasions. 
 
As discussed at the previous ACEAB Conference (Maxwell, 2002), progressive 
assessment blurs the boundary between formative and summative assessment. All 
progressive assessment necessarily involves feedback to the student about the 



Progressive assessment for learning and certification: Some lessons from school-based assessment in Queensland 

 
3 

quality of their performance. This can be expressed in terms of the student’s 
progress towards desired learning outcomes and suggested steps for further 
development and improvement. The point about progressive assessment is not just 
that there are several assessments distributed over a period of time but that later 
assessments allow further improvement on knowledge and skills that were also 
assessed on earlier assessments. As well, as the course unfolds, the assessments 
become more challenging as they encompass more of the learning expectations of 
the course. This operates like a ‘spiral curriculum’. 
 
For this approach to work, it is necessary to express the learning expectations in 
terms of common dimensions of learning (criteria). Then, there can be discussion 
about whether the student is on-target with respect to the learning expectations and 
what needs to be done to improve performance on future assessments where the 
same dimensions appear.  
 
As the student builds up the portfolio of evidence of their performance, earlier 
assessments may be superseded by later assessments covering the same 
underlying dimensions of learning. The aim is to report ‘where the student got to’ in 
their learning journey, not where they started or where they were on the average 
across the whole course. Earlier assessments may be less important than later ones, 
and therefore given less weight, but they also may become redundant in the light of 
later, better and more comprehensive performance as the course unfolds. In a 
portfolio approach of this kind, assessments are not aggregated by some 
mathematical formula to produce an overall result. Rather, the final result involves an 
interpretation of the final (exit) portfolio by a judgment of the standard it demonstrates 
when compared to a set of grade descriptors. 
 
 
Example of criteria from the ‘Drama’ syllabus 
 
In the ‘Drama’ syllabus, there are three criteria for judging the quality of the exit 
portfolio, each with two sub-criteria: 
 

• Forming: creating and shaping dramatic action to communicate meaning and 
to realise a range of dramatic forms and styles through: 

o managing the elements of drama and dramatic conventions 
o integrating content and context. 

 
• Presenting: the performance and communication of dramatic action to others 

by realising dramatic forms and styles through: 
o using elements of drama and dramatic conventions in performance 
o using acting techniques. 

 
• Responding: reflecting on the elements of drama and dramatic conventions, 

content and context, dramatic forms and styles by demonstrating: 
o knowledge, understanding and communication 
o analysis, synthesis and evaluation. (from the Drama syllabus) 
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Appendix 1 gives some examples of assessment approaches in Drama, showing 
how a range of assessment tasks may be involved. Appendix 2 gives the exit criteria 
and standards, that is, standards descripto rs for judging the quality of a student’s 
portfolio. 
 
Another example of criteria, from a Mathematics syllabus, is shown in Appendix 3. In 
Appendix 4 there is a rubric for just one of the criteria of the Earth Science syllabus 
(working scientifically ). Appendix 5 gives two global standards across the three 
criteria in the English syllabus, one for the top (very high) level of achievement and 
the other for the middle level (sound). Together, all these examples illustrate the way 
in which criteria and standards are represented in the syllabuses and reveals 
something of the diversity involved. 
 
 
Updating the portfolio 
 
For any course of study, in reporting the progress made by the student, what is of 
interest is the final state of student’s knowledge and capability. It is of no 
consequence what the state of the student’s knowledge and capability was at the 
beginning of the course. Nor is it particularly relevant what the state of the student’s 
knowledge was at any point earlier than the end of the course. On the other hand, 
progressive or continuous assessment means that evidence of the student’s learning 
is being collected throughout the whole course. Clearly, the point of progressive 
assessment is to diversify the evidence over time and not to depend on a single final 
piece of assessment. So, necessarily, some evidence has been collected earlier than 
right at the end of the course. The question is, then, what emphasis to place on 
earlier information versus later information, or alternatively how to interpret earlier 
performance in the light of later performance. 
 
Some systems of assessment attempt to resolve this dilemma by a numerical 
process of weighting and aggregating marks. Earlier and less significant evidence 
can be weighted less than later and more significant evidence. Some earlier 
assessments might not count at all, that is, receive zero weighting. This is not the 
approach adopted in Queensland. Rather, a holistic judgment is made about the 
quality of the exit portfolio by comparison with the specified exit standards for 
reporting levels of achievement. 
 
The exit portfolio is made up of assessment tasks that represent the fullest and latest 
information on the student’s knowledge and capability. Fullest information means that 
assessment information must be available on all mandatory aspects of the syllabus. 
Important criteria cannot be skipped; the assessment evidence in the portfolio must 
cover all the required aspects of the course. In some cases, a minimum number of 
different kinds of assessment may be required. 
 
Latest information means that earlier assessments that are no longer relevant may 
be discarded and replaced by more recent evidence. That is, later assessments of 
the same type or covering particular criteria may supersede the earlier assessments . 
This process of replacement is itself a matter of on-balance judgment. In some 
cases, where exceptional circumstances apply (illness or other unavoidable 
absence), the later assessment may be unavailable or may not be representative of 
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the student’s performance. Whether to include an assessment item in the portfolio is 
a decision made by the teacher(s) on the basis of the contextual knowledge they 
have about the student. The ultimate aim is to represent the state of knowledge and 
capability as typically demonstrated by the student towards the end of the course. 
 
 
Issues and implications 
 
The approach to assessment described here is one that privileges teacher judgment. 
Necessarily, a large amount of information about student performance must be 
synthesised. The portfolio contains a great deal of information—about each piece of 
assessment and about the whole collection. A comparison is made between the 
overall content and characteristics of the student’s portfolio and the global standards 
for different levels of achievement. This comparison involves judgment, not 
aggregation. That is, it involves determination of the relevance and significance of 
different aspects of the student’s overall profile of performance and the making of an 
on-balance judgment of its merit. This is a deliberate decision. It does not involve the 
application of an algorithm. 
 
One advantage of this approach is that it allows adaptation to different 
circumstances. While the standards are constant, the way in which students 
demonstrate their knowledge and capability against the standards can vary. 
 
Judgments of the standards demonstrated in the portfolio can also be made more 
carefully. It is not unusual for teachers to take some time to arrive at a final judgment 
about the exit level of achievement of a student, particularly a student who may be 
borderline between two levels, or who may have a variable profile across levels, or 
who may be unusual in some way. This is possible because the portfolio is built up 
over the whole course and teachers have a very rich amount of information of the 
student’s capability available to them. While a final decision is needed by a particular 
date, this is known well in advance and there is no reason for a last minute rush. 
 
At the end of the course, there should be no surprises (for both teachers and 
students). Students do not need to wait to learn their final result. It is available to 
them as they exit the course. To a large extent, they are aware of the standard of 
their performance well in advance of the end of the course because they have been 
receiving feedback and advice on the quality of their performances all along the way. 
A final piece of assessment, even if completed on the final day of the course, is 
unlikely to have much impact of the overall message conveyed by the portfolio 
materials collected over the whole course. 
 
The principles of ‘selective updating’ and ‘fullest and latest’ allow poor starts, atypical 
performances, and earlier and temporary confusions (for whatever reason) to be 
ignored and for stronger finishes, more typical performances and later and sustained 
enlightenment to be treated as more important. The spiral nature of assessment—
where the various underlying criteria or dimensions are revisited in different 
assessments over time, that is, where there are several opportunities to demonstrate 
learning outcomes related to the different criteria—allows some degree of 
forgiveness for missed assessments, for example, through illness. In some cases this 
means that earlier assessments are retained in the portfolio because there is no 
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update available. It is conceivable that students might make choices about whether 
they wish to update the portfolio or not. Some students will be satisfied with a lower 
level of achievement than they might achieve with further effort. 
 
The feedback loops involved in this process ensure an emphasis on assessment for 
learning as well as assessment of learning. That is, there is opportunity for 
improvement right through the course. The portfolio is not complete until the end of 
the course. Although assessments along the way become part of the portfolio, 
selective updating allows earlier and weaker performances to be replaced by later 
and stronger performances. It is expected that students will benefit from the feedback 
on earlier assessments and improve their performance on later assessments that 
involve the same criteria or dimensions of learning. 
    
A recent issue has been whether students should be allowed to revisit previous 
assessments to improve the quality of their portfolio. Revisiting might involve ‘having 
another go’ at an assignment, submitting additional assessments or ‘repeating’ a 
portion of the course. In all these cases, the issue is whether a valid interpretation of 
the student level of achievement is made from the evidence.  Where work is refined 
and resubmitted on the basis of teacher feedback, it is sometimes difficult to 
determine the current state of the student’s knowledge and skill, that is, to separate 
the student’s input from the teacher’s. In these circumstances, it may be necessary to 
ask the student to undertake another assessment of a similar nature to discover 
whether the knowledge and skill has been consolidated and is now truly ‘owned’ by 
the student. The same problem may arise with examination questions that the 
student has seen before, as may occur if the student ‘repeats’ a portion of the 
course. In order to gauge the true state of the student’s current knowledge and skill 
when the student is retaking previous assessments, it is necessary to have the 
student complete alternative assessment tasks, that is, assessment tasks that are 
similar yo but different from the assessment tasks previous completed. 
 
 
Lessons 
 
Clearly, since Queensland has been doing assessment for high-stakes assessment 
this way for some time, this approach to assessment is possible. The opportunities 
such an approach presents for making assessment serve learning as well as 
certification, expanding the range of what is learned and assessed, and making 
assessments more authentic, contextualised and meaningful are very attractive. It 
can also be extended to encompass other forms of learning outcomes, for example, 
‘personal learning’ (Cumming, 2002). It also enacts many of the principles identified 
in the landmark research study of assessment by the (USA) National Research 
Council (2001) as desirable in the light of what we now know about human learning. 
 
What is needed to make such an approach successful? Foremost, it is necessary to 
believe that teachers can acquire the appropriate expertise and that they will act 
professionally and ethically. Certainly, a premium is placed on assessment expertise. 
However, the need for teachers to become skilled in conducting assessment 
programs and judging the quality of student performance against defined assessment 
standards creates its own impetus for teachers to acquire these skills. Teachers 
typically take up the challenge when they are given the responsibility. 
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The most powerful means for developing professional competence in assessment is 
the establishment of regular professional conversations among teachers about 
student performance (moderation conversations). This is best focussed on actual 
examples of student portfolios. Looking at actual examples and discussing the 
conclusions that can be drawn about the student’s performance when compared to 
explicit standards sharpens teacher judgment and builds knowledge and expertise 
about assessment more successfully than any other process. 
 
In systems where teacher expertise in assessment is low, it might be preferable to 
begin with lower stakes assessment. Plenty of examples already exist where portfolio 
approaches are being tried in primary schools (for example, see Chetcuti & Grima, 
2002). These can provide inspiration but ultimately local circumstances must be 
accommodated. The best approach in one situation may not be the nest in another. 
 
Selective updating of the student portfolio so that its contents reflect the current state 
of the student’s knowledge and skill is a natural way to ensure that feedback from 
earlier assessment is useful for encouraging student development. It also supports 
assessment for learning as well as assessment of learning. Judgments of the 
student’s level of achievement at particular points in time, such as at the end of a 
course of study, then can be made on the basis of the fullest and latest information 
on the student’s progress. 
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Appendix 1 
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Appendix 2 
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Appendix 3 
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Appendix 4 
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Appendix 5 
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